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DAY 1 KUALA LUMPUR, ARRIVAL

Dive into Kuala Lumpur's vibrant soul today on a cultural joyride through Malaysia's epic
history! Kick things off at the fascinating National Museum where ancient artifacts spill the
country's secrets, then salute the heroes at the dramatic National Monument. Stroll through
Independence Square's colonial charm, gawk at the King's Palace's golden gates, and
snap Insta-worthy shots of the Moorish-style railway station's wedding-cake architecture
(and of course, the jaw-dropping Petronas Twin Towers!). After refueling with delicious
local flavors at lunch, the afternoon is all yours - hunt for batik treasures, sip teh tarik at a
street stall, or just wander where the spicy-scented breezes take you!

KLCC @ Petronas Twin Towers A Famosa Langkawi

DAY 2 KUALA LUMPUR

Touch down in vibrant Kuala Lumpur—where modern skyscrapers meet bustling street
markets—and let the adventure begin! After a warm welcome at the airport, we’ll whisk
you off to your hotel where you can drop your bags, freshen up, and hit the streets to
discover the city’s electric energy at your own rhythm.

ITINERARY

(B/L)

Today we're time-traveling to magical Malacca—where colonial forts, temples dripping in
gold, and streets buzzing with Nyonya flavors bring history to life! You'll walk in the
footsteps of Portuguese conquerors at the crumbled-but-mighty A Famosa fortress, pose
before the candy-red Stadthuys (Malacca’s most Instagrammable landmark!), and discover
17th-century secrets at Cheng Hoon Teng Temple—where incense swirls around intricate
carvings that have stood for 400 years. Then, dive into Jonker Street’s chaos: antique shops
overflowing with treasures, rainbow-colored shophouses, and the scent of pineapple tarts
fresh from the oven—before we whisk you back to KL, where dreams of Peranakan feasts
will dance in your head all night!

DAY 3 KUALA LUMPUR - MALACCA - KUALA LUMPUR

Sleep in or savor a lazy morning—then buckle up for your adventure to Penang,
Malaysia’s island of street art and spice! After we whisk you to your hotel, the day is yours
to dive into Georgetown’s colorful lanes, hunt for famous murals, or just kick back with a
icy cendol dessert. The island time vibes start now!

DAY 4 KUALA LUMPUR - PENANG

Georgetown’s UNESCO magic awaits! Stroll past pastel-hued shophouses, duck into the
Goddess of Mercy Temple’s incense-filled halls, and gawk at the Peranakan Mansion’s
blinged-out antiques—then hop on a flower-bedecked trishaw for the quirkiest joyride in
Malaysia!

Next, zoom up Penang Hill on a vintage funicular (hold your hats—it’s steep!), where misty
jungle views and a hilltop feast with a side of epic panoramas reward your climb. After
lunch with the treetops, we’ll coast back down to reality—but those bragging rights? Yours
forever.

DAY 5 PENANG

(B/L)

(B)

(B/L)



DAY 6 PENANG - LANGKAWI

Today is yours to conquer Langkawi’s wild side—UNESCO-listed jungles, secret waterfalls
& beaches so perfect they look Photoshopped! Zip-line through ancient rainforests, kayak
past crocodile caves (don’t worry, they’re shy!), or just claim a hammock where the
Andaman Sea kisses powdery sand. Adventure or chill? Your call in this geopark paradise!

Penang Bridge Langkawi Island

DAY 7 LANGKAWI, FREE DAY

After breakfast, we'll whisk you away to Langkawi—Malaysia’s dazzling 'Jewel of
Kedah'—where emerald jungles meet powder-soft beaches and adventure awaits! Touch
down in paradise, then let us sweep you off to your resort, where the only decision you'll
need to make is: poolside cocktail or beachfront nap first? 

(B)

Another day in paradise! Langkawi’s UNESCO-listed wonders are yours to explore—chase
waterfalls, lounge on sun-kissed beaches, or embark on a mangrove safari. Adventure or
relaxation? The choice is all yours!

DAY 8 LANGKAWI, FREE DAY

Bask in Langkawi’s island magic until it’s time to bid farewell—we’ll whisk you to the
airport, sending you home with sun-kissed memories and a serious case of paradise
withdrawal! 

DAY 9 LANGKAWI, DEPARTURE

(B)

(B)

(B)
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